

TOMS RIVER REGIONAL SCHOOLS		BID REVIEW	
SITE-189 Parking Lot Paving Improvement at Various Locations (Referendum Project - Phase II)			
Receipt Date: 05/01/2020			
Black Rock Enterprises Inc. (1)		Earle Asphalt Co (*)	Lucas Brothers Inc.
OPTION # 1 WITH PLA		REJECT	
Proposal "A" Items 1-52		\$2,245,514.83	No Bid
Proposal "B" Items 53-104		\$1,633,633.96	No Bid
Proposal "C" Items 105-156		\$1,425,196.80	No Bid
TOTAL BASE AMOUNT BID:		\$5,304,345.59	\$4,596,595.00
Proposal "C" Alternate "A" Int South		\$206,531.48	\$157,433.44
GRAND TOTAL BID:		\$5,510,877.07	\$4,754,028.44
OPTION # 2 WITHOUT PLA			
Proposal "A" Items 157-208		No Bid	\$2,138,465.55
Proposal "B" Items 209-260		No Bid	\$1,589,846.15
Proposal "C" Items 261-312		No Bid	\$1,368,215.20
TOTAL BASE AMOUNT BID:		\$4,219,613.13	\$5,096,526.90
Proposal "C" Alternate "A" Int South		\$150,500.00	\$177,017.61
GRANT TOTAL BID:		\$4,370,113.13 (*)	\$5,273,544.51
(1) REJECT BID AS NON- RESPONSIVE. BIDDER DID NOT SUBMIT SUBCONTRACTOR'S REQUIRED AFFIDAVIT OF NO MATERIAL ADVERSE CHANGE.			
(*) AWARD - TOTAL CONTRACT AMOUNT: \$4,370,113.13 (WITHOUT PROJECT LABOR AGREEMENT)			