

VENDOR	ITEMS	AMOUNT
Efinger Sporting Goods 513 W. Union Ave. Rt. 28 Bound Brook, NJ 08885	104	\$33,799.56
All American Co. 1320 Taylor St. Elyria, Ohio 44035	9	1,988.50

FALL
SPORTS
UNIFORMS &
SUPPLIES
CONT'D

Item K motion that the Board of Education RECORD bids received February 5, 1988 for EDUCATIONAL ROBOTIC TEACHING SYSTEM as follows:

RECORD BIDS
EDUCATIONAL
ROBOTIC
TEACHING
SYSTEM

Grodberg Computer Services
317 Marc Dr.
Toms River, NJ 08753

NO BID

Information Products of South Jersey
980 Shrewsbury Ave.
Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

NO BID

Westar Computer Systems, Inc.
632 Ocean Road (Rt. 88)
Pt. Pleasant, NJ 08742

NO BID

Minnesota Educational Computing Corp.
3490 Lexington Avenue North
Saint Paul, MN. 55126-8097

NO BID

Feed Back Inc.
620 Springfield Ave.
Berkeley Heights, NJ 07922

\$4,980.00

Brodhead Garrett
223 South Illinois Ave.
Mansfield, Ohio 44905

NO BID

Item L motion that the Board of Education RECORD bids received March 29, 1988 for LEASE-PURCHASE OF 3 TYPE B - 18 PASSENGER SCHOOL BUSES as follows:

RECORD BIDS
LEASE-
PURCHASE OF
3 TYPE B
18 PASSENGER
SCHOOL
BUSES

VENDOR	TOTAL
H.A. DeHart & Son Crown Point Rd. Thorofare, NJ 08086	\$115,216.35
General Leasing 3301 Route 66 Neptune, NJ 07753	106,836.60
Wolffington Body Co. Rt. #38 Mt. Holly, NJ 08060	100,642.50
Matthews Buses, Inc. 3103 Veeder Ave. Toms River, NJ 08753	NO BID

STITUTE ACHERS T'D	Dorat, Patricia 146 Longboat Ave. Beachwood, NJ	Raulerson, Diane 54 Vermont Ave. Jackson, NJ	Robertson, Andrew J. 1107 Wall Road Spring Lake Hgts, NJ
	Salins, Andris 425 Bergen ave. Lakewood, NJ	Shaw, Annette 891 B. Stratford Ct. Lakehurst, NJ	Silva, Patricia A. 1871 Monitor Dr. Toms River, NJ
	Silverman, Douglas 136 Newbury Rd. Salem Hill, NJ	Soviero, Margret 105 Leanne Dr. New Egypt, NJ	Spahr, Thomas 8 - 10 Landis Way Mystic Island, NJ
	Strauss, Lorraine 50 Cory Dr. Toms River, NJ	Thompson, Nancy L. 7 Pennsylvania Ave. Jackson, NJ	Van Nest, Barbara 813 Marla Dr. Pt. Pleasant, NJ
	Veres, Joseph 328 Farmingdale Rd. Jackson, NJ	Weinberg, Janice 74 B Valley Rd. Jackson, NJ	Wells, Kathleen E. 51 Citadel Dr. Jackson, NJ
	Woods, Jeanne 1075 Lake Placid Dr. Toms River, NJ		

IREMENT Item B motion that the Board of Education record, with regret, the retirement of the following teachers:

M. INSON	Mrs. Mildred Robinson Eff: 7/1/88 Brick Exp. - 20 yrs.	Midstreams Speech Therapist
E. IRER	Mrs. Edith Lehrer Eff: 7/1/88 Brick exp. - 30 yrs.	Herbertsville Grade 2
A. UINING	Mrs. Anna Bruining Eff: 7/1/88 Brick exp. - 26.4 yrs.	VMES Kindergarten

SIGNATION Item C motion that the Board of Education accept the resignation of the following teachers:

D. ERMANN	Mrs. Deborah Hoermann Eff: 6/30/88 Brick exp. - 13 yrs.	BTMHS Soc. St. (LOA)	Personal
B. VENDER	Mrs. Bonnie Lavender Eff: 6/30/88 Brick exp. - 14 yrs.	Drum Point Spec. ED. (LOA)	Relocated
K. ATING	Mrs. Kathryn Keating Eff: 6/30/88 Brick exp. - 7 yrs.	BTHS Science (LOA)	Personal

D.A. Item D motion that the Board of Education approve the request for a leave of absence, for the following teacher:

S. OGH	Mrs. Sandra Balogh Eff: 4/25/88 - 6/30/88 Brick exp. 9 yrs.	BTHS Guidance	Personal reasons/ Without pay
-----------	---	------------------	----------------------------------

Item F motion that the Board of Education approve that contracts of employment, for the 1988-89 school year, not be offered to the non-tenured teaching staff, as per the following:

CONTRACTS
NOT BE
OFFERED
NON-TENURED
TEACHERS

Drobes, Rochelle	Eremux, Jon	Fabach, Jane
Gorlich, Michele	Heller, Romayne	Laird, Ann
Lorusso, Patricia	Mulligan, Patricia	Noonan, Sharon
Septoff, Dorothy	Stier, Cindy	Tombs, Carol
Holly, Brian	Soper, Constance	Walters, Charles
Bryer, Linda	Reilly, Barbara Ann	Lindahl, Patricia
Leger, Joanne	Koziol, Lois	McKibbin, Lydia
Tice, Amy	Williamson, David	Allen, Anne
Abramo, Valerie	Karatz, Carol	Evans, Nancy
Kubinski, Diane	Rieder, Gayla	Esposito, Alyce
Genco, Stephen	Possumato, Sandra	

Item G motion that the Board of Education approve the contracts of employment, for the 1988-89 school year, not be offered to the tenured teaching staff, as per the following:

CONTRACTS
NOT BE
OFFERED
TENURED
TEACHERS

Loveland, Wayne Dunbar, George

Item H motion that the Board of Education approve the re-employment of 49 non-tenured teachers, for the 1988-89 school year, as per the following:

RE-EMPLOY
NON-TENURED
TEACHERS

*Adams, Robert	*Adis, Denise	Allen, Kim L.
Amodio, Ann Louise	*Argondizza, Louis	*Caldes, Richard
Cantagallo, Joan	*Caris, Bonnie	Carofalo, Enza
*Cook, Nancy L.	Cooke, Patricia	*Czarnecki, Doris
D'Amore, Anthony	D'Andrea, Dennis	*Damiano, Gail
DeFrancisci, Judith	*Ferrara-Marra, Mary	Finn, Angie
Fitzgerald, Sharon	*Gamble, Susan	*Gerlock, Joanna
*Jones, Lori	Kardell, Edward	*Kardell, Linda
*Kawa, Cindy	King, Patricia	*Lemig, Margaret
Lewis, Jane	Malone, Theresa	Martone, Maria
*McCullough, Daniel	Metnick, Ann	*Nacarlo, Judith
*Napier, Denise	Paasch, Denise	Palisi, Marianne
Paris, Pamella	Phillips, Claire	*Piantadosi, Sherilyn
Pohle, Doris	Robertson, Mary	Robinson, Elaine
*Roloff, Linda	*Shotwell, Steven	Steffy, Carolyn
*Stump, Donna	Vie Brock, Christine	Cittadino, Garry
*Going under tenure 9/1/88	Gerlock, Jenifer	Susan
**Going under tenure during th 1988-89 school year		

Item I motion that the Board of Education approve the employment of 563 tenured teachers, for the 1988-89 school year, as per the following:

EMPLOY
TENURED
TEACHERS

Adams, Mary	Alberts, Irene	Allen, Flora
Allsopp, Mary	Amodio, Michael	Anderson, Virginia
Andrews, Jay C. Jr.	Andrews, Jay K.	Andrews, Susan
Antonacci, Denise	Archimbaud, Adrian	Arensdorf, Suzanne
Armellino, Patricia	Asony, Wayne	Auriemma, Robert
Bace, Carol	Bach, John	Bach, Mary
Baker, Christy	Baker, Ruth	Ball, Allan
Balogh, Sandra	Barnfield, Glenn	Barnfield, Odette
Barr, Patricia	Barry, Linda	Barton, M. Charlotte
Barton, Pamela	Barton, Susan	Baxter, Gloria

TENURED
TEACHERS
CONT'D

Baxter, Thomas
Bennett, Maureen
Billfrman, Diane
Bishop, Richard
Blair, Donald
Blomquist, Margaret
Boesch, Ann
Bottone, Kathleen
Boyle, Susan
Brewer, Nancy
Brosius, James
Brown, Donovan
Brunner, William
Buehner, Fred
Burns, James
Bush, Janet
Calabro, James
Campbell, Madelyn
Cantoli, Kathleen
Caravella, Anthony
Carpenter, Judith
Carter, Noeline
Catania, Salvatore
Ceres, Mary Ann
Chambers, Darryl
Choo, Soo-Un
Clemente, James
Collins, Christine
Constantine, Terry
Cook, Mary Jane
Cowen, Clifford
Cozza, Robert
Crider, James
Cuthbert, Allan
Dagostino, Louise
Darnell, William
DeLanoy, Nancy
Demalik, Joseph
DiFabio, Nancy
Dipietro Purcell, Edwina
Doege, Elsa
Donatiello, Lenora
Dooros, John
Doran, Robyn
Dougherty, John
Duddy, Daniel
Dunbar, Wilbur
Dutton, Barbara
Elkinton, Earl C. Jr.
Erickson, Lois
Farley, Carol
Fierro, Ronald
Fischer, Jacquelynn
Fleming, Mary
Flynn, Brian
Forney, Sheila
Fox, Julie
Frankewicz, Ann
Fudali, Martin
Gary, Cynthia
Gauer, Glenavie
Gawlik, Joseph

Bearmore, Marion
Beyer, Mary Ann
Billick, Jeri
Bittenbinder, Barbara
Blank, Ellen
Bocchetti, Richard
Bonventre, Kathleen
Boudreau, Joseph
Breault, Maureen
Brigance, Sally
Brower, Gail
Brown, Marjorie
Buchanan, Rosalie
Buell, Janet
Burns, Lois
Buttimore, Denise
Calogero, Dolores
Campomenosi, William
Capitano, Joseph
Carlough, Melvin
Carr, James
Cassie, Rochelle
Catrambone, Frances
Cerven, James
Chenoweth, Joan
Ciesla, Darlene
Clifford, Maureen
Conlan, Rita
Contreras, Susan
Corino, Lynn
Cox, Kathryn
Craner, Sarah
Cronin-Hull, Marie
Cuthbert, Renee
Dalrymple, Susan
Davey, Robert
DeRiso, Linda
Demarest, Carolyn
DiBenedetto, Moira
Doege, John P. Jr.
Donovan, Carol
Dooros, Regina
Dorney, Dorothy
Dougherty, Thomas
Duffy, Dorothy
Dunn, Patricia
Early, Rita
Ellis, Marilyn
Essner, Catherine
Felz, Fred
Filippone, Dennis
Fitzpatrick, Susan
Fletcher, Faith
Folley, Patrick
Forsyth, Nancy
Frank Diou, Bette
Fraraccio, Joan
Galietti, JoAnne
Gaskill, Ronald
Gaul, Holly
Gaye, Thomas

Benedict, Robert
Bieliick, Connie
Bird, Joan
Blackman, Susan
Blanken, Anthony
Bodnar, Barbara
Bossard, Cynthia
Boylan, Patrick
Brenner, Jill
Briscoe, Kathleen
Brown, Christine
Brown, Michael
Buehner, Carol
Bukowski, Raymond
Burton, Geraldine
Cahill, Joseph
Campbell, Kevin
Cangelosi, Margaret
Capitano, Rosemary
Caroselli, Robin
Carroll, Bernadine
Castellano, Denise
Cavanaugh, Penelope
Cerven, Joann
Chojancki, Mary Ann
Clarke, Susan
Cole, Gregory
Connelly, Patricia
Cook, Christopher
Costello, Lisa
Cox, Robert
Crescenzo, Lucille
Cucz, Jill
Dagostino, Gerard
Dalton, William
DeFeo, Lisa
DeTata, Angelo
Demarest, Harold J. Jr.
Dillon, Joan
Disbrow, Marianne
Donatiello, Eugene
Donovan, Helaine
Doran, Lillian
Dorsett, Joan
Drackwicz, Laura
Dunbar, Sandra
Durante, Carolyn
Eid, Patricia
Engle, Diane
Estelle, Milton
Fiengo, Nancy
Finnerty, Richard
Fix, Richard
Floyd, Pheobia
Forker, John
Foster, Maria
Frank, Richard
French, Worden
Gall, Michael
Gaskin, Conover
Gauslin, Esta
Gentile, Barbara

Gentile, Nicholas
Gesser, Elizabeth
Giavatto, John
Godbold, Barbara
Gooley, Pamela
Green, C Thomas
Gregitis, Vincent
Hall, Linda
Hampson, Eileen
Handschuch, James R.
Harris, Judith
Hedden, Karen
Henkel, Neal
Hocking, Ralph
Hoffman, Sharon
Horoski, Valerie
Hudak, John
Hurst, June
Inderwies, Marcella
Jeck, Barbara
Juba, Ronald
Kasyan, Deborah
Kaye, Jerome
Keleher, Kathy
Kennedy, William
Kiendel, Paul
Kinney, Cynthia
Kinstler, Richard
Kodan, Nancy
Kohlrenken, Jane
Kozlowski, Caryl
Krauss, Kristine
Kuch, Donna
Kuntz, Carol
Lane, Joan
Lawson, Pricilla
Leard, Ronald
Leighton, J. Peter
Lewis, Joseph
Logan, Lynn
MacDougall, Susan
Maione, Elisa
Mancuso, Janys
Marino, Barbara
Marshall, Joseph
Mason, Elizabeth S.
Mayer, Eileen
McCabe, James
McClory, Richard
McGrath, Jeanine
McMunn, Meghan
Meehan, Irene
Metnick, Neal
Miller, Catherine
Molnar, Susan
Moore, Angela
Mosso, Joseph
Munoz, Zoila
Nelson, Barbara

Gerlock, Ruth
Gialanella, Thomas
Gilinsky, Lillian
Godlesky, Adrian
Graham, Lillian
Greenhalgh, Herbert
Grossberg, Ava
Hamner, Etta
Handchen, Harold Jr.
Hankins, Vernon
Hayes, Martha
Hellwig, Howard W Jr.
Hill, Marijane
Hoffman, Costance
Hogan, Dolores
Horrocks, Donna
Hull, Robert
Husko, Alice
Irre, Dorothy
Jerolaman, Steven
Kaiser, Jacqueline
Kasyan, Frank
Kazima, Stanley
Keller, Charlene
Kenny, Linda
Kiewe, Marilyn
Kinney, Gail
Kiziukiewicz, Anthony
Kohler, Gerald
Kosattis, Kostandinos
Kraft, Deborah
Krieg, Ann
Kuhn, Devin
Kuntz, James
Lastella, Sharon
Lazzaro, Valeria
Lebret, Claire
Leta, Karen
Linnett, Linda
Lozar, Carol
Madeiros, Margaret
Majury, Nelson
Manzi, Thomas
Marino, Salvatore
Martucci, John
Mastik, Charles
McBride, Joseph
McCabe, John
McCormack, Andrew
McGuire, William
McNamara, Kathryn
Mertens, Gwendolyn
Metzger, Sophia
Millwater, Nancy
Monahan, Eugene
Moore, Sandra
Muehter, Manfred Jr.
Myers, Charles
Nickerson, Einesmary

Gernert, Vicki
Glaquinto, Michael
Gleason, Daniel
Goldsmith, Myrna
Green, Arlene
Gregitis, Kathleen
Grove, Charles
Hampel, Lydia
Handchen, Rick
Harrigan, Mary
Heckendorn, Rosemary
Hendricks, Cindi
Hoban, Sharon
Hoffman, Robin
Hopson, Susanne
Huacuja, Marcia
Hulse, Lorraine
Hyer, Barbara
Jardot, Joseph
Jones, Belinda
Kastel, Janis
Katz, Arthur
Kearney, Marie
Kennedy, Helenanne
Kerwin, Thomas
Kingman, Patricia
Kinsella, Edward
Kobilnyk, Marie
Kohler, Helen
Kozikowski, Leona
Krausman, Joanne
Krol, Michael
Kulat-Hodges, Marie
LaGratta, Thomas
Lawrence, Victoria
LeMore, Mary
Leighton, Elayne
Lewis, Eileen
Lockwood, Timothy
Ludovico, Leonard
Magnotti, Priscilla
Malony, Donald
Maragno, Sal
Marousis, Crystal
Mason, Elizabeth A.
Matthies, Bonnie
McCabe, Charles
McCafferty, Alan
McDaniels, Beverly
McManus, Linda
McDonald, Gail
Messemer, Robin
Meyer, Barbara
Mitchell, David
Moor, Patricia
Moroni, Leon
Muller, Noelle
Nash, Grace
Niven, Paula

32
TENURED
TEACHERS
CONT'D

Noferi, Oneta
Novak, Donald
O'Brien, Laurie
O'Neill, Marie
Olsen, Harold
Otto, Susan
Panuska, Paul
Pasciolla, Anthony
Pearson, Marjorie
Petty, Richard
Pickering, Thomas
Post, Margaret
Previte, Donna
Prunetti, Joan
Racanelli, Frank
Rahill, Joan
Reilly, Barbara
Repsher, Ellen
Riello, Samuel G Jr.
Robin, Rochelle
Rohland, Dorothy
Ross, Douglas
Russomano, Michael Jr.
Sample, Nancy
Saporito, Maureen
Savage, Kathleen
Scaturro, Lenora
Schleig, John O Jr.
Sciaretta, Marjorie
Scutro, Mary
Sevastakis, George
Shagner, Donna
Simon, Robin
Smith, Carole
Smith, Victoria
Starzman, Linda
Stephens, Nancy
Taggart, Edward
Tassinaro, Marlyn
Thran, MaryAnn
Tomaselli, Clarissa
Tunis, Amelia
Tylka, Susan
Vares, Veva
Viscomi, Palma
Wagner, Nancy
Warnick, Ralph E. Jr.
Webber, Thomas
Welter, ChristyAnn
Whelan, Nancy B.
Whittley, Joyce
Wilson, Beverly
Wolfe, Jane
Wright, Patricia
Yamaji, Donna
Zdanowski, Anthony
Zezula, Joanne
Zinno, Vincent

Norby, Karen
Novak, Paula
O'Connor, Catherine
O'Neill, Terence
Orlofsky Zalinsky, Sandra
Palen, Marianne
Parani, Kathleen
Patterson, Claire
Pegg, Gloria
Pfeiffer, Joan
Pierce, Edward
Power, Judy
Prisco, Angela
Pruzzo, Katherine
Radoslovich, Joseph
Regenye, Edward
Reinertsen, Carol
Restiano, Joanna
Riva, Darlene
Roche, Kathyanne
Rosamilia, Ramon
Rossi, Gene
Sangiorgio, Michael
Sarraf, Linda
Scaduto, Louis
Schembari, Catherine
Schneller, Donna
Scisco, Linda
Segaloff, Virginia
Sfarra, AnnMarie
Sharp, Robert
Sked, Sarah
Smith, Elizabeth
Sorrentino, Lucia
Stavitsky, Marion
Stepniak, Adele
Taggart, Lillian
Ternosky, Paul
Tirpack, Donna
Tomkowich, Elena
Tutzauer, Gary
Van Schoick, Susan
Velchik, John Jr.
VonSuskil, Kathleen
Waldron, Marsha
Warren, Linda
Weiss, Denise
West, Dale
White, Susan
Wight, Kathleen
Wilson, Laurie
Woolley, Lillian
Wright, Shirley
Yarusinsky, Elaine
Zettel, Angelina
Zimmer, John
Zolkiewicz, Mary

Norcia, Anthony J. Jr.
Noxon, Patricia
O'Connor, Robert
O'Rourke, Thomas
Palisi, Bernice
Parriski, Edward
Pavia, Frank
Perreault, Barbara
Picarell, Janice
Poretskin, Marilyn
Powers, Robert
Prisco, Ellen
Puglisi, Wayne
Ragati, Mary
Reid, Donal
Reinhart, Patricia
Richwine, Patricia
Rizzitello, Barbara
Rogers, Donald
Rosenberg, Pamela
Rowe, Monica
Rutter, James
Sanko, Diane
Sauerberger, Debra
Scarola, Angelo
Schioppa, Anthony
Schnitzer, Renee
Scott, Amy
Sendzik, Maria
Shaffer, Patricia
Sherengos, William
Smerillo, Diane
Smith, Suzanne
Spada, Robert
Stella, Arlene
Swanick, Joanne
Tallent, Cecelia
Thompson, Denise
Titus, Kathleen
Tubby, Geraldine
Tylka, Gordon
Vanderslice, John
Vicari, Annette
Voorhees, Dorothy
Walsh, Eileene
Webb, Janice
Weiss, MaryAnne
Wheeler, Nancy
Whittaker, Roberta
Williamson, Doris
Wolf, Warren C.
Woolley, MaryLou
Wurtzel, Carol
Yates, Joan
Zezula, E. John
Zink, Diana

Item J motion that the Board of Education approve the re-employment of the ROTC Instructors, for the 1988-89 school year as follows:

REEMPLOY
ROTC
INSTRUCTORS

M/Sgt. James Tierney - Maj. Bill Franco

Item K motion that the Board of Education approve the contracts of employment for the 1988-89 school year, be offered to a non-tenured Supervisor, and a non-tenured high school principal as per the following:

CONTRACTS
NON-TENURED
SUPERVISOR
&
PRINCIPAL

Vicari, Joseph	\$53,320.00	Regan, M. Daniel	\$61,870.00
----------------	-------------	------------------	-------------

Item L motion that the Board of Education approve the contracts of employment, for the 1988-89 school year, be offered to tenured Principals, Vice Principals and Supervisors as per the following:

CONTRACTS
TENURED
PRINCIPALS,
VICE
PRINCIPALS

Brooks, Bartholomew	\$62,125.00	Tomaselli, Joseph	\$54,300.00
*Berger, Charlotte	50,120.00	Wolfersberger, James	52,075.00
*Herman, Fred	50,375.00	Rao, George	57,115.00
Rochford, James	57,115.00	*Dutton, William	43,610.00
Vivino, David	54,810.00	Pagano, Philip	61,125.00
Lynch, Harvey	61,125.00	Messemer, Raymond	56,625.00
Handschuch, Richard	54,575.00	*Dooley, Joan	42,855.00
*Zink, Ronald	50,375.00	Benedict, Raymond	60,125.00
Aragona, Rosemary	56,065.00	Davis, Stanley	60,125.00
Eid, Joseph	60,125.00	Stavres, Nicholas	59,870.00
Napier, James	58,625.00	*DeBenedictis, Andrew	50,625.00
Bittenbinder, Gerald	53,320.00	Underwood, Frederick	53,575.00
*Treger, Carol	43,610.00	*Conover, F. Aldyth	40,365.00
Richardson, James	60,850.00	*Holmes, Robert	46,620.00
Oxenford, Vilma	54,967.00		

*Ten Months

Item M motion that the Board of Education approve the contracts of employment for the 1988-89 school year, be offered to tenured Administrators, as per the following:

CONTRACTS
TENURED
ADMINISTRATORS

Aragona, Louis	\$86,510.00	Wolf, Warren H.	\$77,850.00
Stutts, Robert K.	69,800.00	Mayer, Joseph G.	68,300.00
Murphy, James D.	68,300.00		

Item N motion that the Board of Education approve the appointment of Schedule D Positions as follows:

APPOINT
SCHEDULE D
POSITION

Kim Evans, Asst. Girls' Spring Track Coach, BTHS	\$1,900.00
--	------------

Item O motion that the Board of Education approve the request for a leave of absence, for the 1988-89 school year, for the following teacher:

L.O.A.
R.
DOOROS

Mrs. Regina Dooros	District	Maternity Leave/
Eff: 9/1/88 - 9/30/88	Social Worker	With Pay
Brick exp. - 15 yrs.		

Item P motion that the Board of Education approve Steven Jerolaman as Head Football Coach at Brick Township Memorial High School at a salary pending contract negotiations, effective July 1, 1988.

HEAD
FOOTBALL
COACH
B.T.M.H.S.

PERSONNEL
NON-
TEACHING

Motion was made by Mr. Readell, seconded by Mrs. DeConde and carried unanimously by roll call Items A - 0 under Personnel Non-Teaching.

APPROVE
TEMP.
EMPLOYMENT
SUB. SCHOOL
BUS DRIVER

Item A motion that the Board of Education approve the temporary employment of the following people to the position of substitute School Bus Driver, at an hourly rate of \$6.88, subject to all Civil Service rules and regulations, effective from the first day of employment, pending receipt of license:

JoAnn Desiderio
13 Primrose Lane
Brick, NJ 08724

Arnold Fromowitz
122 Second Ave.
Asbury Park, NJ 07712

John Koester
366 Church Road
Brick, NJ 08723

Theodore Tobiasen
899 Linden Ave.
Brick, NJ 08723

Estelle Lasky
384 Georgia Dr.
Brick, NJ 08723

Donald Randolph
53 Country Club Crt.
Brick, NJ 08723

APPROVE
RE-EMPLOYMENT
TEMP. SUB.
SCHOOL BUS
DRIVER

Item B motion that the Board of Education approve the temporary re-employment of John Washington, to the position of substitute School Bus Driver, at an hourly rate of \$6.88, subject to all Civil Service rules and regulations, effective from the first day of employment.

APPROVE
TEMP.
SUB. BUS
ATTENDANT

Item C motion that the Board of Education approve the temporary employment of the following people to the position of substitute Bus Attendant, at an hourly rate of \$5.66, subject to all Civil Service rules and regulations, effective from the first day of employment.

Patricia Bruns
244 Kentwood Blvd.
Brick, NJ 08724

Marguerite Bruns
111 Briar Mills Dr.
Brick, NJ 08724

Dolly Rosenthal
327 Saw Mill Rd.
Brick, NJ 08724

APPROVE
TEMP. RE-
EMPLOYMENT
SUB. FOOD
SERVICE WKR.

Item D motion that the Board of Education approve the temporary re-employment of the following people to the position of substitute Food Service Workers, at an hourly rate of \$4.56, effective from the first day of employment:

Lillian Caracelli

Alberta T. Collins

RESIGNATION
R.
FRANCESE

Item E motion that the Board of Education record the resignation of Rosalie Francese, from her position as Food Service Worker/4 hrs. effective March 1, 1988.

APPROVE
ADDITIONAL
LONGEVITY
M.

Item F motion that the Board of Education approve the additional longevity for Milton Teeple, Supervising School Bus Driver, in the amount of \$200.00, for fifteen (15) years of service, effective May 1, 1988.

TEEPLE
APPROVE
L.O.A.

Item G motion that the Board of Education approve the leave of absences for the following non-teaching personnel:

Roberta Merten
School Bus Driver
Personal - 3/8/88-
0/7/88 (without pay)

Linda Mowadia / Senior Clerk Typist/10 month
Personal - 3/11/88 - 3/23/88
4/13/88 - 4/26/88 (without pay)

James A. Rose
Custodial Worker
Medial - 4/11/88-9/7/88
Without pay

Mark F. Neafie
Custodial Worker
Personal - 4/11/88 - 10/10/88
Without pay

L.O.A.
CONT'D

Joseph Jazikoff
Custodian
Military -4/24/88 - 4/29/88
With Pay

Judy Polhemus
School Bus Driver
Personal 0 3/30/88 -6/30/88
Extended (Without pay)

Item H motion that the Board of Education record the resignations of the following non-teaching personnel, effective as follows:

RESIGNATION

Daniel Pronti
Sub. Custodial Wkr.
Eff: 4/1/88

Peter F. Tracy
Sub. Bus Driver
Eff: 3/24/88

Steve Milano
Custodial Wkr.
Eff: 3/14/88

Bonnie Porbansky
Food Serv. Wkr./4 hrs.
Eff: 3/25/88

Item I motion that the Board of Education approve the regular appointment of Raymond Markese, 6 Cork Place, Forked River, NJ, to the position of Custodial Worker, at an annual salary of \$11,565., step 1, effective March 21, 1988, subject to all Civil Service rules and regulations, including the three month working test period.

R.A.
CUSTODIAL
WORKER
R.
MARKESE

Item J motion that the Board of Education approve the regular appointment of Kathleen Wagner, to the position of School Bus Driver, in accordance with Civil Service Certification of Eligibles dated March 11, 1988, at an annual salary of \$10,243., step 1, retroactive from March 22, 1988, subject to all Civil Service rules and regulations, including the three month working test period.

R.A.
SCHOOL BUS
DRIVER
K.
WAGNER

Item K motion that the Board of Education record with regret the retirement of Robert Kollor, from his position as Warehouseman, effective April 1, 1988. Mr. Kollor has been with the Brick Township School District for 13 years.

RETIREMENT
R.
KOLLOR

Item M motion that the Board of Education approve the regular appointment of Susan Aymar to the position of Food Service Worker/4 hours, effective April 11, 1988, at an annual salary of \$3,986., Step 1, subject to all Civil Service rules and regulations, including the three month working test period.

R.A.
FOOD SERVICE
WORKER
S.
AYMAR

Item N motion that the Board of Education approve the appointments of the following people to the position of Custodial Workers, at an annual salary of \$11,565., Step 1, effective March 29, 1988, subject to all Civil Service rules and regulations, including the three month working test period.

R.A.
CUSTODIAL
WORKERS

John P. Westdyke
73 Burnt Tavern Rd.
Brick, NJ 08724

Bernard Howe
1635 Rt. 88 West
Brick, NJ 08723

J.
WESTDYKE
B.
HOWE

Item O motion that the Board of Education approve the contracts of employment and salaries for the 1988-89 school year for all permanent and provisional non teaching personnel as follows:

APPROVE
CONTRACTS
&
SALARIES
CIVIL
SERVICE
PERSONNEL

Susan Aymar	\$ 4,191.	Gail Albanese	\$14,861.
Cornelia Alexy	14,100.	Robert Alexy	29,573.
Carol Allen	12,836.	Kathryn Amalfa	30,290.

CONTRACTS &
SALARIES
CIVIL
SERVICE
PERSONNEL
CONT'D

David L. Anderson	\$27,640.	William P. Anderson	\$31,351.
Eleanor Anstett	22,975.	William Apuzzo	24,209.
Louis Argondizza	16,029.	William Aromando	25,190.
Keith Austin	12,467.	Frank Backle	17,190.
Rose Bambo	13,819.	June Barclay	15,043.
Delores Bassinder	14,861.	Mary Bejger	21,860.
Katherine Belardo	4,840.	Charles Bergen	14,963.
Patricia Bernard	30,290.	Kathleen Berrios	12,836.
Mary Bertero	15,197.	Camille Bilello	4,501.
Jeanne Bird	25,024.	Irene Bisogno	13,824.
Ellen Black	10,062.	Josephine Blandina	4,501.
Edward Boden, Jr.	23,525.	Ann Borowicki	10,328.
Arlene Bottone	11,205.	Theodore Bottone	11,908.
Maureen Boyle	16,010.	Janet Brannick	12,594.
Lynn Brannick	19,846.	Adrianna Boeni	22,975.
Theodore Brower	18,600.	Rita Bourbon	5,647.
Karen Branch	4,339.	Elizabeth Brennan	10,909.
Robert Buchta	17,273.	Mary Burke	23,525.
Mary Buono	5,320.	Patricia Cahill	12,095.
Angelo Cappetta	43,942.	Jacqueline Caravella	15,197.
Joyce Carr	13,581.	Veronica Cassidy	11,908.
Rocco castellano	14,493.	Philip Chadwick	31,351.
Anna Cirigliano	23,267.	James Clague	16,864.
Mary Cmur	5,647.	Katherine Cole	4,840.
Beverly Colpaert	13,311.	Margaret Connolly	11,725.
Evlyn Cowan	24,209.	Frances Crawford	17,682.
Donald E. Carter	16,864.	Anita DaCruz	11,908.
Josephine Damico	5,020.	Frances Daughton	14,100.
Anthony Davison	17,911.	Harry A. Degnan	12,467.
Anthony DeRosa	21,174.	Eileen DiBella	22,975.
Antonio DeChiara	27,128.	Carole DiNetta	10,909.
James DiNetta	23,650.	Edmund J. Doran	13,444.
Delores Doran	11,377.	Thomas Doran	16,202.
John Dorritie	16,878.	Gloria Doyle	30,290.
Audrey Dowd	13,824.	James Dunn	17,564.
Marlene Early	21,772.	Joseph Ernst	24,209.
William Ernst	23,525.	Audrey Erickson	11,287.
Al Essner	13,444.	Charles Falkinburg	17,911.
Freida Fall	25,834.	Teresa Fallon	15,197.
Charles Fay, Jr.	18,864.	James R. Fay	12,467.
Thomas Fay, Jr.	16,029.	Thomas Fay, Sr.	25,117.
George C. Ferguson	12,947.	Louise Ferrulli	14,100.
Thomas Fiorentino	17,741.	Doris Firestone	5,020.
Anthony Florentine	12,947.	Joan Fogarty	10,909.
Lawrence Fogarty	23,525.	Cosmo Fontana	14,355.
Dorothy Frawley	16,575.	Mary Frazee	8,698.
Thomas Frese	18,864.	Gladys Garcia	15,197.
Sue Garner	12,365.	Glenn Gauer	14,693.
Mary A. Gehring	24,824.	Lucille Genco	30,290.
Stephen Gerlock	14,493.	Anthony Giacini	13,444.
Claire Gianettino	10,328.	John Gianettino	13,824.
Mary Gillen	11,538.	Sharon A. Giusto	4,339.
Ruth Joan Gilmore	15,400.	Jane Glenn	25,434.
Doris Gordon	22,975.	William Gordon	43,282.
Henry Grapatin	26,628.	John Greene, Jr.	14,493.
John Greene, Sr.	13,444.	Michael Greene	12,947.
Edward Grischbowsky	16,202.	Nancy Grischbowsky	23,525.
Joseph Guagliardo	22,176.	Gladys Guercia	11,908.
Mary Ann Guidice	16,809.	Mary Lou Hahn	17,239.

Vickie Hammell	\$15,109.	Caroline Havens	\$20,978.
Joan Havens	11,310.	Valeria Havens	10,653.
Caroline Hayes	15,197.	Edward Heinis	15,027.
Roseann Heitner	21,523.	Robert Henehan	15,027.
Mary Henson	13,824.	Ann Marie Heruska	14,493.
Mary Holler	11,467.	Marie Horak	14,861.
John M. Horan	12,467.	Bernard Howe	12,028.
Edward Howland	31,151.	William Hratko	31,351.
Joseph Hufford	13,444.	David Hughes	12,836.
Constance Iacopino	23,767.	John Inderweis	12,467.
Richard H. Jahn	13,147.	Margaret Jalowski	23,362.
Joseph Jazikoff	27,378.	Joyce Johnson	16,202.
Raymond Johnson	15,999.	Regina Johnson	20,576.
Florence Jones	14,175.	John Paul Jones	15,227.
Carol Kampf	15,032.	Janet Kearns	13,639.
Dorothy Keleman	16,809.	Robert J. Kemmler	12,467.
Julia Keenan	9,295.	Lester Keenan	22,975.
Ruth Kennedy	5,788.	Constance Kerr	12,630.
Dorothy Kinney	30,290.	Patricia Kinsella	21,073.
Mary Kirgan	8,864.	Elvira Kish	13,824.
Barbara Klinetob	22,975.	Wesley Knight	12,667.
Walter J. Korch	13,147.	Martin Kraidman	13,444.
Theresa Krakosky	12,594.	Donald Kraus	29,605.
Keone Kraus	21,523.	Ellen Krautheim	12,365.
Betty Kull	13,581.	Edward Kunyz, Jr.	12,467.
Edward Kunyz, Sr.	15,027.	Frances C. Lake	16,809.
George F. Lake, Jr.	16,809.	Justine Lane	5,020.
Barbara LaPatta	14,100.	Margaret Larkin	25,634.
Ernest Laughlin	12,028.	Agnes Layton	15,804.
Linda LePore	4,339.	Mildred Liberatore	13,581.
Patricia Lloyd	13,686.	John Locklin	31,151.
Mary Ann Logan	12,721.	Nicholas Lucian	12,365.
Ruth Madge	16,010.	Olga Majeski	18,154.
Joseph Makransky	15,027.	Denise Malone	23,267.
Collen Martin	11,538.	Patricia Maslen	11,310.
Margaret Mattson	5,647.	Amelia Maute	22,975.
Vivian Mawhinney	15,197.	Barbara Mazzacco	4,339.
Robert Merten	12,467.	Robertta Merten	11,467.
Joan Merola	4,667.	Patricia Mesgleski	20,576.
Gregory Metelski	13,444.	Donald Meyer	22,164.
Kathleen Meyer	14,443.	Joan Meyer	5,788.
Valerie Meyer	13,824.	Geraldine Migliorisi	6,495.
Bruce Miller	21,112.	Fern Miller	12,365.
Raymond Miller	31,151.	John Mills	15,227.
Barbara Minard	11,908.	Susan Monaghan	13,156.
Linda Montanaro	14,861.	Dorothy Moore	11,941.
Mary Moran	14,100.	Anne Morano	12,671.
Betty Mount	4,840.	Sandra Mount	24,209.
Raymond Mount	35,448.	Patricia Morris	13,056.
Linda Mowadia	12,095.	Joseph Mrozowski	15,604.
Diana M. Muller	4,339.	Doris Mulvaney	23,362.
Nicholas Murgolo	17,314.	Samuel Muzeni	15,999.
Beatrice McAdam	20,978.	Dennis McClory	15,820.
Rita McCormick	13,824.	Brian F. McCrudden	12,947.
Joseph McCullough	22,975.	Patrick McCullough	14,493.
C. Robert McDermott	12,836.	Gloria McDermott	14,100.
Genevieve McGinley	15,720.	Kathleen McGovern	4,501.
Richard McGowan	12,467.	Eleanor McGuire	5,647.
Helen McIntyre	25,024.	Gerald A. McKenna	14,693.
Patricia McNamara	15,220.	Maureen McMahan	12,095.
Victoria McManus	4,501.	Barbara Nardiello	23,525.

37

CONTRACTS
&
SALARIES
CIVIL
SERVICE
PERSONNEL
CONT'D

CONTRACTS
&
SALARIES
CIVIL
SERVICE
PERSONNEL
CONT'D

Diane Nase	\$12,836.	Josephine Nativo	\$44,501.
Mark Neafie	12,947.	Thomas Neafie	12,947.
Carol Nebesne	13,824.	William Newman	22,975.
Jean Niedzwiecki	15,400.	Joseph Nunziato	23,525.
Francis Nunziato	31,623.	Bobbi O'Brien	10,653.
MaryEllen Occhicone	12,202.	Vincent O'Halloran	14,355.
Dorothy O'Hare	24,824.	Jean O'Pray	23,362.
Theresa Orenchuk	16,217.	Emma Pal	15,197.
William Palangio	16,878.	Andrew Paterson	38,133.
Theresa Patterson	12,330.	Elena Pavlak	14,100.
Charles J. Pavlak	15,079.	Donna Perrapato	12,095.
Joseph W. Pesco	16,841.	Denise Pezarras	15,451.
Edward Pierce, Sr.	25,317.	Florence Pinkava	13,156.
Thomas Piscatelli	15,641.	Michael Plaschke	17,911.
Barbara Poli	15,197.	Albert Pollock	25,117.
Constance Poppe	11,908.	Michele Poppe	12,598.
Wilma Poppe	13,824.	Grace Posa	4,339.
Mary Powner	4,339.	Lynn Prendeville	11,310.
Rosemary Pronti	15,800.	Antoinette Queck	14,443.
James E. Quinlan, Jr.	18,800.	Lucille Raimondo	4,501.
Josephine Rataski	5,647.	Robert W. Readell	13,989.
Loretta Redmond	12,095.	Edward Reid	31,151.
Richard Revell	13,824.	Margaret Riccio	10,653.
John Richards	27,328.	Thomas Reilly	14,693.
Grace Reinders	18,153.	Marion Rinaldi	19,957.
Audray Roblenski	11,316.	Judith Polhemus	13,311.
Fred Prumachuk	15,027.	Carolyn Rogers	11,467.
Dorothy Rogers	21,827.	George Rogers	22,176.
Dolores Rongo	18,556.	James Rose	13,444.
Edward Rossi	17,226.	Patricia Rowley	22,975.
Rosemary Russell	10,021.	Philomena Russo	5,647.
Fred Sackman	14,493.	Gerhard Schadwill	21,374.
Jean Schill	17,773.	Daniel Scarpati	13,824.
Geraldine Schneider	25,834.	Dorothy Schnorrbusch	11,287.
Grace Schultz	12,397.	James Scott	15,804.
Ruthann Seidel	15,800.	Gary Seiger	13,444.
Robert Selk	25,117.	Richard Sendzik	22,176.
Helen Serden	5,020.	Mark Severin	16,864.
Patricia Shea	11,287.	John Shimko	22,176.
Robert E. Shipley	15,027.	Vincent Sidtis	17,741.
Theresa Sihler	9,650.	Donald Silva	14,355.
Barbara Silva	11,467.	William Simonsen	11,908.
Paula Beth Singer	6,234.	Raymond Sippel	15,841.
Kathryn Smith	16,010.	Mary Jean Smith	10,039.
Dorothy Smyth	15,451.	Dorothea Soucek	17,301.
Geraldine Struening	18,077.	Carol Statuto	10,062.
Gail Stutts	11,538.	Helen Taylor	17,727.
Hazel Teeple	23,525.	Milton Teeple	24,209.
Fred A. Testa	18,507.	Edward J. Thompson	11,456.
Joan Thompson	15,042.	Barbara Tobiassen	14,423.
Camille Townsend	16,798.	Raymond Trainor	12,467.
Ann Trione	11,287.	Joan Mae Trione	10,653.
Joan M. Trione	16,809.	Angelina Trottini	13,581.
Thomas Tuning	11,467.	Beatrice Tuorto	12,721.
Jeanette Trotter	10,062.	Jeanette Vacante	14,476.
Mary Vankruiningen	8,022.	Barbara VanSyckel	14,025.
Patricia Vermeal	13,824.	John Waitz	23,525.
Felicia Washco	11,840.	Mary Weimer	16,402.
John P. Westdyke	12,028.	Nancy Whelan	25,634.
Doris Whitley	23,525.	Eve Weinberg	25,834.
Clarence M. White	15,227.	Camille Wilkinson	24,824.

Lauretta Wirth	\$24,646.	Judith Wooley	\$14,443.
Thomas Wooley	38,092.	Edward Woytowicz	27,128.
Barbara Wylie	18,064.	Kathleen Wagner	10,243.
Dorothy Young	10,328.	Dorothy Zack	13,311.
Muriel Zehntner	30,290.		

Motion was made by Mrs. Benton, seconded by Mrs. DeConde and carried unanimously by roll call vote Items A - H under Auxiliary:

AUXILIARY

Item A motion that the Board of Education accept reports submitted as follows:

REPORTS

Secretary's Report (February) Field Trips
Custodian of School Moneys Report (February) Suspensions
Investment Schedule for March 1988

Item B motion that the Board of Education be advised of the following information with regard to Enrollment:

ENROLLMENT

	As of March 30	February
Kindergarten to 6	4249	4245
Grades 6-8	1797	1797
BTHS	1469	1482
BTMHS	1330	1337
Specials	395	392
Bedside	41	42
Total	9281	9295

Item C motion that the Board of Education approve the graduation dates for Brick Township High School and Brick Township Memorial High School for Thursday, June 16, 1988 with Friday, June 17, 1988 as a rain date. In the event the schools are closed for any reason, the graduation dates will be changed to reflect additional days required to meet the 180 school days prior to graduation.

GRADUATION
DATES
BTHS &
BTMHS

Item D motion that the Board of Education approve the promotion date for Lake Riviera Middle School and Veterans Memorial Middle School for Wednesday, June 15, 1988.

PROMOTION
DATES
LRMS &
VMMS

Item E motion that the Board of Education approve the out-of-district placement of one student at the Rugby School, starting 3/9/88 at an annual tuition of \$12,621.60, pro rated.

O-O-D
PLACEMENT

Item F motion that the Board of Education approve the new contract to transport one student to the Rugby School, Wall for 62 days, starting 3/14/88, via American Multi-Transportation, Route #10, at a total cost of \$47.00 per diem.

CONTRACT
AMERICAN
MULTI-TRANS

Item G motion that the Board of Education approve the out-of-district placement of one student at the Ocean Road School, Pt. Pleasant, starting March 10, 1988, at a cost of \$6,935. pro rated.

O-O-D
PLACEMENT

Item H motion that the Board of Education approve the out-of-district placement of one student at the Alpha School, starting March 23, 1988 at a cost of \$12,500. pro rated.

O-O-D
PLACEMENT

IMPORTANT
DATES

Mr. Williamson reviewed Important Dates as follows:

May 5, 1988 - Pre-Agenda Meeting - 7:30 p.m. - Administration Building

May 12, 1988 - Regular Public Meeting - 7:55 p.m.
Administration Building

May 30, 1988 - SCHOOLS CLOSED - MEMORIAL DAY

MINUTES

3/3 & 3/10/88 Motion was made by Mr. Readel, seconded by Mrs. DeConde with the following roll call vote for the Board of Education to approve the Minutes of March 3, 1988 - Pre-Agenda Meeting and March 10, 1988 - Regular Public Meeting and Budget Hearing; Mrs. DeConde, yes; Mr. Cevalasco, abstain; Mr. Readel, yes; Mr. Stites, yes; Mr. D'Ambola, abstain; Mrs. Benton, yes; and Mr. Williamson, yes.

FINANCE &
BUSINESS
COMMITTEE

Mr. Williamson then requested Mrs. DeConde and Mr. Stites to remain on the Finance and Business Committee to provide continuity and stated that the other committees would be assigned at a later meeting.

Mr. D'Ambola, Mr. Cevalasco and Mrs. Benton thanked the voters for electing them and stated that they look forward to a productive year.

AUDIENCE

The meeting was opened to the public and many questions were asked from the audience regarding problems connected with using Osbornville School for general elections, holding California tests right after school vacations, the desire of Drum Point School to dedicate the gymnasium to Dave Buchy, unfreezing Lake Riviera Middle School Library Funds, standardizing the reading program throughout the district, the possibility of having a full time nurse for Herbertsville School. All questions were addressed by Board Members and/or Administrators, those that could not be answered immediately were to be researched and answered at a future meeting.

BOARD APPRE-
CIATION OF
RETIRING
MEMBERS

Board Members all expressed their feelings of appreciation for all that Mr. Roblenski had done while Board President and they welcomed the new Board Members and thanked the voters for passing the Budget. Dr. Aragona and Mr. Wolf also thanked Mr. Roblenski and Mr. Laura and extended their welcome to the new members.

ADJOURN

At 8:56 p.m., motion was made by Mr. Stites, seconded by Mr. Readel and carried unanimously by roll call vote to adjourn this meeting.

Respectfully submitted,

Kathryn Amalfa

Kathryn Amalfa