

Motion was made by Mr. Bertrand, seconded by Mr. Donofrio and carried unanimously that the Board of Education Record Bids for Lumber Supplies received April 14, 1981 as follows:

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>NUMBER OF ITEMS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Standard Lumber & Building Supply Co. 133 Ocean Avenue Lakewood, NJ 08701	13	\$ 5,755.75

Reisen Lumber & Millwork 1070 Morris Avenue Union, NJ 07083	13	\$ 2,814.84
---	----	-------------

Glen Rock Lumber & Supply Co., Inc. Route 70 Brick, NJ 08723	13	\$ 6,105.46
--	----	-------------

I. S. D., Inc. 1812 Underwood Blvd. Delran, NJ 08075	1	\$ 2,690.00
--	---	-------------

East Coast Acoustics, Inc. 29 Redwood Drive Toms River, NJ 08753	1	\$ 2,688.00
--	---	-------------

Motion was made by Mr. Bertrand, seconded by Mr. Donofrio and carried unanimously by roll call vote that the Board of Education Award Bids for Lumber Supplies received April 14, 1981 as follows:

Standard Lumber & Building Supply Co.	5	\$ 991.56
---------------------------------------	---	-----------

Reisen Lumber & Millwork Co.	2	\$ 683.30
------------------------------	---	-----------

Glen Rock Lumber & Supply Co.	5	\$ 616.92
-------------------------------	---	-----------

East Coast Acoustics, Inc.	1	\$ 2,688.00
----------------------------	---	-------------

Motion was made by Mr. Bertrand, seconded by Mr. Donofrio and carried unanimously that the Board of Education Record Bids for Paint Supplies received April 14, 1981 as follows:

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>NUMBER OF ITEMS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Siperstein's 1 Princeton Avenue Brick, NJ 08723	46	\$ 7,381.45

M.A. Bruder & Sons, Inc. 600 Reed Road Broomall, Pa.	41	\$ 7,042.48
--	----	-------------

<u>Record Bids</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>NUMBER OF ITEMS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
<u>Paint</u>	Anglo American Varnish Co.	46	\$ 7,180.99
<u>Supplies</u>	1400 Roller Road		
<u>Continued</u>	P.O. Box 2288		
	Ocean, NJ 07712		

Con Lux Coatings Inc.	17	\$ 7,109.25
Talmadge Road		
Edison, NJ		

Award Bids Motion was made by Mr. Bertrand, seconded by Mr. Donofrio and carried unanimously by roll call vote that the Board of Education Award Bids for Paint Supplies received April 14, 1981 as follows:

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>NUMBER OF ITEMS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Sipersteins's	19	\$ 3,760.85
M.A. Bruder & Sons	8	\$ 323.98
Anglo American Varnish Co.	16	\$ 2,210.45
Con Lux Coatings Inc.	2	\$ 666.00

Record Bids Motion was made by Mr. Bertrand, seconded by Mr. Donofrio and carried unanimously that the Board of Education Record Bids for Electrical Supplies received April 14, 1981 as follows:

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>NUMBER OF ITEMS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Memphis Lamp Inc.	1	52% discount
P.O. Box 12273		Trade Service
2500 Broad Avenue		Publication
Memphis, Tenn. 38112		
Rale Electric Supply Co.	17	50% Discount
809 1st Avenue		Trade Service
Asbury Park, NJ 07712		Publication
Graybar Electric Co.	17	12% Discount
1300 Livingston Avenue		Trade Service
North Brunswick, NJ 08902		Publication

Award Bids Motion was made by Mr. Bertrand, seconded by Mr. Williams and carried unanimously by roll call vote that the Board of Education Award Bids for Electrical Supplies received April 14, 1981 as follows:

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>NUMBER OF ITEMS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Rale Electric Supply Co.	17	50% Discount
		Trade Service
		Publication

Motion was made by Mr. Bertrand, seconded by Mr. Donofrio and carried unanimously that the Board of Education Record Bids for Corrective Work and Track Resurfacing Brick Township High School Stadium received May 20, 1981 as follows:

Record Bids
Corrective
Work and
Track
Resurfacing

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>CONTRACT</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
General Construction Equipment Leasing, Inc. 280 Chelsea Ave. Long Branch, NJ	1-A 1-B 1-C 2	\$59,680.00 \$58,680.00 \$88,680.00 No Bid
Country View Inc. 150 New Brunswick Rd. Somerset, NJ	1-A 1-B 1-C 2	No Bid No Bid No Bid \$54,957.00
The Vestull Company P.O. Box 245 220 Broad Street Carlstadt, NJ 07072	1-A 1-B 1-C 2	No Bid No Bid \$91,070.00 No Bid
Cedar Hill Landscaping R.D. #3 - Box 440 Cedar Lane Grove Somerset, NJ 08873	1-A 1-B 1-C 2	No Bid No Bid No Bid \$58,596.00
Asplundh Landscape Blair Mill Road Willow Grove, Pa. 19090	1-A 1-B 1-C 2	No Bid No Bid No Bid \$71,450.00
Valley Paving Company 83 Grant Street Ramsey, NJ 07465	1-A 1-B 1-C 2	\$98,200.00 \$98,200.00 \$102,440.00 No Bid
Seasonal Garden & Landscape Service, Inc. 55 Union Road Spring Valley, NY 10977	1-A 1-B 1-C 2	\$77,000.00 \$67,000.00 \$93,000.00 \$59,000.00

Motion was made by Mr. Bertrand, seconded by Mr. Donofrio and carried unanimously by roll call vote that the Board of Education Award Bid for Corrective Work and Track Resurfacing Brick Township High School Stadium received May 20, 1981 as follows:

Award Bids
Corrective
Work & Track
Resurfacing

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>CONTRACT</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
General Construction Equipment Leasing, Inc.	1-B	\$58,680.00

Motion was made by Mr. Bertrand, seconded by Mr. Donofrio and carried unanimously by roll call vote that the Board of Education Reject Bids on Contract 2.

Reject Bids
Contract 2

44
At 8:13 p.m. the action agenda meeting was closed and public discussion period declared open.

The subject of student deployment was presented by Mr. Wolf and questions from the public in this regard answered.

Mr. Donofrio advised the board members of the defeat of Senate Bill No. 750.

Dr. Aragona made mention that the Superintendent's Report to the County Superintendent must be prepared soon.

At 8:30 p.m. by motion of Mr. Bell, second of Mr. Donofrio and unanimous agreement this meeting was adjourned.

Respectfully submitted,

Josephine Damadio
Josephine Damadio

June 2, 1981
Brick Town, New Jersey

The Brick Township Board of Education held a Work Session and Pre-Agenda Meeting on Tuesday, June 2, 1981 at 7:00 p.m. for the purpose of discussing problems under Building and Grounds and possible litigation and immediately followed by the Pre-Agenda Meeting.

Present were: Mr. Hancock, Mr. Bell, Mr. Bittmann (7:45 p.m.), Mr. Donofrio, Mrs. Fox (8:10 p.m.), Mr. Bertrand, and Mr. Williams.

Also present: Dr. Aragona, Mr. Stutts, Mr. Sendzik, and Mr. Wolf (8:00 p.m.)

Mr. Stutts announced that the New Jersey Open Public Meetings Law Sunshine Law was enacted to insure the right of the public to have advance notice of and to attend the meetings of public bodies at which any business affecting their interests is discussed or acted upon.

In accordance with the provisions of this Act, the Brick Township Board of Education has caused notice of this meeting to be published by having the date, time, and place thereof posted as follows on May 28, 1981: Board Office Bulletin Board, Asbury Park Press, Ocean County Times-Observer, Municipal Clerk, and Brick Town News.

At 7:03 p.m. Mr. Stutts read the following resolution to go into executive session which was approved by Mr. Bell, second of Mr. Donofrio and unanimous agreement:

Executive Session

WHEREAS, C.231, P.L. 1975 also known as the Sunshine Law, authorizes a public body to meet in executive or private session under certain limited circumstances; and

WHEREAS, said law requires the Board to adopt a resolution at a public meeting before it can meet in such an executive or private session;

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF EDUCATION OF THE TOWNSHIP OF BRICK SCHOOL DISTRICT:

- 1) That it does hereby determine that it is necessary to meet in executive session on this date to discuss matter involving anticipated litigation and personnel items.
- 2) That the matter discussed will be made public if and when confidentiality is no longer required and action pursuant to said discussion shall take place only at a public meeting.

The submittals by the Birdsall Corporation of Belmar, New Jersey were reviewed with regard to anticipated litigation. Their fee schedule was reviewed, and direction was given to our legal staff as to questions to be posed to this company with regard to the extent they will be willing to go as far as testifying in the event of any legal action. A consensus was taken of the board and it was unanimous that this Corporation be retained. Direction was given to place an item on the Action Agenda to formally approve employment of the Birdsall Corporation.

Birdsall Corporation

6/7/81

It was agreed, due to anticipated litigation, that all correspondence, etc. with Birdsall Corporation is to go through Mr. Anton's office. It was further agreed, that all other correspondence heretofore relating to Memorial High School construction is to go directly to the attorney.

Discussion of monies owed to the contractors on Memorial High School resulted in a direction that Mr. Sendzik will determine the merits of individual payments to individual contractors, (other than retainages) and make recommendations to the Business Office as to their payment.

It was agreed that an architect would be needed to be employed with regard to the improvements to be made to small group instruction areas and emergency classrooms.

It was also agreed that an Action Agenda item be prepared regard the construction and necessary materials for a refreshment stand at Memorial High School.

Mr. Sendzik is to send a letter to Mr. Cottrell asking him to come in and look at Memorial High School and give the Board a report, as per his function for the Township.

Personnel

The personnel items on the Pre-Agenda were discussed and direction given as to which items are to be put on the Action Agenda for June 10, 1981.

In a discussion regard Camp Beadleston, a thought was expressed that a letter be written to the Township as far as jointly sponsoring this service.

Grievance matters were referred to and explanations given by Mr. Stutts.

At 8:37 p.m. motion was made by Mr. Bell, seconded by Mr. Donofrio and agreed to by all to open the Pre-Agenda Meeting as scheduled. At this time, Mr. Stutts again read the Sunshine Law.

Cardamone

Mr. Robert Cardamone was present to give a presentation with regard to our insurance program and his insurance bid for same. Mr. Stutts advised that we had received two bids and that Mr. Cardamone was low bidder. Many, many questions were asked and answered on all areas of insurance that the Board of Education carries.

Mr. Cardamone was advised that his employment would be an item on the June 10th agenda.

JR.Sports League

A request from the B.T. Jr. Sports League with regard to use of approximately four acres of land adjacent to Boland Field of the 14.88 acres known as Block 1428, Lot 3 (McCormick tract) belonging to the Brick Township Board of Education. It was agreed that there are many things to be checked out, including the D.E.P. reports on the land, possible need at a future date for school construction, etc. These items will have to be researched before any definite approval can be given to the Jr. Sports League.

An item to discuss the approval or rejection of a \$2,700. Energy Grant resulted in a decision to reject same.

47

Mr. Donofrio referred to S-750, a bill which has gone back into Committee and after discussion of same, Dr. Aragona was directed to write a letter to our legislators advising them that we are in opposition to this bill.

Security employees for Memorial High School was discussed and it was agreed that we will hire two until the end of this school year, and discuss, prior to the Action Agenda on June 10th, the need for employment of security for that school for the summer.

Discussion of agenda items continued with direction given as to which were to be placed on the Action Agenda for June 10th.

It was requested that Mrs. Burgess be invited to a board meeting, preferably the June 22nd meeting, to be introduced to our board members and answer a few questions that they have.

The employment of a School Auditor was referred to a committee of three, Mr. Bittmann, Mr. Bell, and Mr. Hancock. They are to contact and interview same, and hopefully be able to make a recommendation for employment of one at our Special Meeting on June 22nd.

Dr. Aragona was given permission to have early dismissal on June 24, 1981, the last day of school for students.

He further notified the board members that staffing is a little more complicated this year, and he would like to set a date to sit down and review staffing. It was agreed that this should be a work session of the full board.

At 10:40 p.m. motion was made by Mr. Williams, seconded by Mr. Bittmann and carried unanimously to adjourn this meeting.

Respectfully submitted,

Josephine Damadio
Josephine Damadio

June 10, 1981
Brick, New Jersey

The Brick Township Board of Education held their Regular Public Meeting at 7:55 p.m. on Wednesday, June 10, 1981 at Veterans Memorial Middle School preceded by a Work Session at 7:30 p.m. to discuss employment of security for Memorial High School.

Present were: Mr. Hancock, Mr. Bell, Mr. Bertrand (7:47 p.m.)
Mr. Bittmann, Mr. Donofrio, Mrs. Fox, and Mr.
Williams.

Also present: Dr. Aragona, Mr. Wolf, Mr. Stutts, and Mr. Sendzik.

Sunshine Law

Mr. Stutts announced that the Open Public Meetings Law was enacted to insure the right of the public to have advance notice of and to attend the meetings of public bodies at which any business affecting their interests is discussed or acted upon.

In accordance with the provisions of this Act, the Brick Township Board of Education has caused notice of this meeting to be published by having the date, time and place thereof posted, as follows on June 4, 1981: Board Office Bulletin Board, Asbury Park Press, Ocean County Times-Observer, Municipal Clerk and Brick Town News.

Security Personnel

Mr. Wolf presented an outline of a plan for security coverage for the district for the summer months. It was agreed by all attending board members to approve that employment of the six security guards be included on the June 22nd Special Meeting agenda, and that said employment be for the 1981-82 school year.

At 7:55 p.m. Mr. Stutts again read the New Jersey Public Meetings Law, as stated above. Roll call was again called.

Presentations were made at this time to Mrs. Alice Frake and Mr. Norman Schue, past board members commending them on their years of service to this district.

Minutes

Motion was made by Mrs. Fox, seconded by Mr. Donofrio and carried unanimously by roll call vote that the Board of Education approve the following Minutes:

May 13, 1981 - Regular Meeting
20 - Special Meeting

Retain Birdsall

Motion was made by Mrs. Fox, seconded by Mr. Bell and carried unanimously by roll call vote that the Board of Education approve items (a) and (b) under building and grounds as follows:

That the Board of Education retain Birdsall Corporation, 1700 F Street, Belmar, New Jersey to do all engineering field work inspections, analysis, depositions, interrogatories, professional testimony, measurement and testing as required to support the Board of Education and its legal staff in its investigation of the construction of Brick Township Memorial High School. The Birdsall Corporation will be retained as per the 1981 fee schedule submitted to this board May 27, 1981.

That the Board of Education authorize Mr. Robert K. Stutts, Business Administrator/Board Secretary, to prepare necessary specifications for the construction of a refreshment stand, storage building, and bathroom facility to be located at Brick Township Memorial High School stadium area, material estimated at \$20,000.00. (The construction work will be completed by our own personnel. Specifications will apply to the purchase of the material only.)

Motion was made by Mrs. Fox and seconded by Mr. Bell that the Board of Education approve that Mr. Don Gatarz be authorized to prepare necessary specifications and plans for the improvement of small group instructional areas and emergency classrooms necessary to obtain approval from the County Superintendent of Schools in the amount of \$1200. A roll call vote was taken with the following results: Mr. Bell - yes; Mr. Bertrand - no; Mr. Bittmann - yes; Mr. Donofrio - yes; Mrs. Fox - yes; Mr. Williams - yes; and Mr. Hancock - yes.

Don Gatarz

Motion was made by Mr. Donofrio, seconded by Mr. Bell and carried unanimously by a roll call vote that the Board of Education approve items (a) and (b) under the title of Curriculum and Instruction as follows:

That the Board of Education authorize application for funds under the provisions of P.L. 94-482 for the following Project: Career Staff Infusion Program in the amount of \$21,100.

That the Board of Education approve payment of honorarium to Dr. Zacharie Clements in the amount of \$1,800. plus lodging and travel expenses, to give a presentation to Brick Township staff and community on September 18, 1981.

Dr. Clements

Motion was made by Mr. Bittmann, seconded by Mr. Donofrio and carried unanimously by a roll call vote that items (a) through (h) under the title of Finance and Business be approved as follows:

That the Board of Education approve payment of Vouchers in the amount of \$2,355,868.39, as follows: Vouchers

<u>REGULAR BILL LIST</u>	\$ 347,969.31
<u>UTILITIES</u>	59,634.75
<u>PAID SINCE PREVIOUS MEETING</u>	267,056.92
<u>PAYROLL - MAY, 1981</u>	<u>1,688,445.41</u>
<u>GRANT TOTAL</u>	\$2,355,868.39

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
ABC School Supply	\$ 142.24
Acme Typewriter Center	855.52
Action Discount Copier	75.90
Action Printing	59.90
Advanced Management Re	49.50

<u>Vouchers</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
<u>Continued</u>	Agway, Inc.	\$ 123.24
	Alan's Florists	26.25
	Allied Boiler Repair	1,192.45
	Mary Allsopp	11.12
	Allyn & Bacon	14.81
	Alpha School	2,540.00
	Ambicab Inc.	630.00
	American Assoc on Ment	15.95
	American Taxi	19,923.96
	Anaheim Publishing Co.	37.15
	Martin B. Anton	250.00
	Dr. Louis Aragona	435.00
	Adrian Archimbaud	9.60
	Michael Arnone	59.00
	Audio Brandon	417.50
	Avalon Cleaners & Shoe	393.75
	Carol Bace	24.88
	Marilyn Baker	13.60
	Baker & Taylor Co.	456.81
	Bancroff School	1,300.00
	Barnell Loft, Ltd.	93.51
	Glenn C. Barnfield	181.25
	Bass Repair Service	742.87
	Belmar Camera Shop	46.80
	Raymond Benedict	87.50
	Robert A. Benedict	6.50
	Charlotte Berger	202.78
	Jeanne H. Bird	9.60
	Gerald Bittenbinder	50.00
	Dick Blick	1,805.26
	Board of Ed City of As	6,644.00
	Books Mobile, Inc.	147.84
	Boro Busses Co.	1,465.00
	John J. Boyle	152.80
	Brick Starter & Alternator	213.76
	Brick Twp. Heating & A	1,750.00
	Brick Town Medical Group	345.00
	Brick Township Board of	28,556.86
	Brick Twp High School	1,958.67
	Brick Twp High School	42.25
	Brick Twp Memorial High School	91.50
	Brodhead-Garrett Co.	1,441.87
	Brookdale Community Co.	4,540.20
	Bart H. Brooks, Principal	87.50
	William F. Brouillette	101.50
	William Brunner	27.28
	Janet Bush	26.30
	Brenda Cantrell	17.92
	Rosemary Capitano	123.02
	Angelo P. Cappetta	163.21

VENDORAMOUNTVouchers
Continued

Carolina Biological	\$ 73.00
Carson-Dellosa Publ	31.79
Center Lumber Company	813.00
Central Uniform Service	192.00
Charney's of Toms River	92.00
Childcraft Education	13.86
Children's Day School	3,600.00
Soo-Un Choo	48.10
Darlene Ciesla	15.04
Circle Arts & Crafts I	49.42
Cloth World of Laurelton	524.25
Coastal Learning Center	3,235.50
Coast City School Buses	14,067.50
Coast Cities Truck Sales	219.59
Coast Welding Supplies	151.66
Collier School	720.00
Colony Market	100.00
Pat Connelly	11.29
Consolidated Terminal	940.00
Connecticut General Li	101,912.22
Coskey's Electronic Sy	118.50
Robert Cozza	9.00
Creative Publications	519.10
John J. Crescenzo	87.50
Croft Nei Publications	27.12
Crosswicks Industries	79.90
CTB-McGraw Hill	3,087.43
Rosemary Cunningham	75.00
William Darnell	102.70
Stanley Davis Principal	87.50
Andrew DeBenedictis	87.50
Decision Data Computer	161.00
John DeMartino	326.23
Demco Educational Corp.	1,061.64
Development Learning	750.84
Devereux Foundation	720.00
A B Dick Co.	817.36
James DiFabio	50.00
Walter Donovan	175.00
Joan Dooley	50.00
Regina Dooros	6.94
Thomas Dougherty	175.00
Dorothy Duffy	4.06
Deborah Dunkle	14.90
Duplicating Products	558.81
William Dutton	75.00
EBSCO Subscription	52.73
Educational Activities	228.84
Educational Consulting	9,537.24
Educational Filmstrips	77.00

<u>Vouchers</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
<u>Continued</u>	Educational Reading Se	\$ 123.60
	Educational Testing Se	175.00
	Efinger Sporting Goods	49.33
	Joseph Eid	87.50
	Estes Industries	125.37
	Eye Gate Media	1,049.00
	S. Finkelstein	42.01
	Andy Flory	54.00
	Focus Master, Inc.	90.75
	Fodors & McKay	92.25
	Follett Library Book	2,107.40
	Franklin Clay Films	215.00
	Sam French	800.00
	W. French	29.22
	Gann Law Books	25.00
	Gaylord Bros Inc	3,786.21
	General GMC Sales, Inc	150.99
	General Roofing Co.,	52.80
	Georges Auto Radiator	136.00
	Gibco Diagnostics	25.00
	Globe Book Co., Inc.	87.89
	Barbara Godbold	138.50
	William Gordon	108.30
	Greensteel Inc.	678.00
	Guidance Associates	131.36
	JL Hammett Co.	172.42
	Hammetts Learning World	82.94
	Harold Handchen Jr.	11.20
	Richard Handschuch	175.00
	Fred Herman	75.00
	Hewlett-Packard	12,679.08
	Bill Hoermann	175.00
	Robert Holmes	75.00
	Holt Rinehart & Winsto	1,145.16
	Valerie Horoski	49.25
	Victor Hotho & Co.	132.06
	Marcia Huacuja	114.29
	Barbara Hyer	11.64
	International Business	1,989.26
	IBM	138.62
	Intech Leasing Corp.	380.00
	International Thomson	32.69
	Interpretive Education	26.23
	Interstate Printers &	23.25
	Dr. A. Isseroff	200.00
	Debra Jakubiak	23.85
	Priscilla Jeck	21.52
	Jep Sales Inc.	135.40
	Jersey Central P&L Co.	36,591.71
	Jersey Coast Fire Prot	22.75

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Jersey Tab Card	\$ 337.50
Johnson's Pt. Pleasant Ha	240.65
Jonah Service	13.30
Rose Jones	500.00
Laura Kacicz	18.58
Kaplan School Supply	224.11
Kar Products, Inc.	101.44
Rochelle Karp	175.00
Richard N. Kellner, MD	413.00
Helenanne Kennedy	37.60
Kepwell Spring Water C	78.40
Thomas Kerwin	41.92
Walter Kide Sales & S	547.75
Kimbo Educational	56.98
Richard C. Kinstler	3.07
Maria Kotlar	120.00
Norma Krol	365.00
Marie J. Kulat	7.28
Carol Kuntz	30.63
Lake Riviera Middle School	20.00
Lakewood Board of Education	180.00
Lanes Mill School	38.66
Lang's Auto Supply, In	229.68
Agnes W. Layton	9.60
Learning Tree Filmstrip	71.38
Val Leming	500.00
Leone's Art Studio	850.00
Lewmar Paper Company	508.62
Lincoln Transit Co. Inc.	442.15
Lincoln Transit Company	1,206.75
Listening Library Inc.	78.85
Litton Educational Pub	73.08
Lynn Logan	40.41
Marion A. Ludgate	13.44
Helen Ludovico	37.80
Harvey J. Lynch, Principal	87.50
Manchester Twp-Bd of E	593.80
Mantek	116.32
Joseph Mayer	112.50
Joseph McBride	19.20
Beverly McDaniels	16.76
McGraw-Hill Book Co.	45.89
Melad Associates	116.28
Charles E. Merrill	35.90
Raymond K. Messemer	50.00
Neal Metnick	9.36
Microsette Co.	32.50
Middle Atlantic Press	30.56
Modern Curriculum Pres	1,333.35
Modern Gas Service	210.25
Modern Print Service	3,529.00

VouchersContinued

<u>Vouchers</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
<u>Continued</u>	Jesse S. Morie & Son	330.22
	Manfred Muehter, Jr.	10.80
	Mulligan Craft Supply	52.64
	Geraldine Munn	10.48
	James D. Murphy	203.26
	James Napier	50.00
	NASCO	6,067.94
	Nat'l. Ass'n. of Sec School	313.50
	National Computer System	3,009.00
	National Office Equip.	556.14
	Neptune Board of Education	4,000.00
	New Jersey Audio Visual	73.15
	NJ Bell Telephone Co	7,996.77
	New Jersey Boy's Town	540.00
	New Jersey Council of	40.00
	NJ Natural Gas Co	15,046.27
	NJ Public Broadcasting	12.25
	Nicholas Books	278.84
	Norcostco, Inc.	3,115.71
	Ocean County College	288.00
	Ocean County Landfill	16.65
	Ocean County Landfill	29.70
	Ocean County Math Coun	60.00
	Ocean County Reading	131.00
	Ocean County Unit	430.00
	Ocean Ice Palace Incor	1,080.00
	O'Neill, Terence	30.80
	Vilma Oxenford	50.00
	Philip E. Pagano	112.50
	Pathway School	1,880.00
	Frank Pavia	28.46
	J W Pepper Son, Inc.	503.65
	Pepper Music Co.	808.83
	Armand Piantadosi	87.50
	Pied Piper Productions	64.58
	Pine Belt Chevrolet	8.84
	Pitney Bowes	72.15
	Pleasantville Music Sh	4,043.47
	Steve Poretskin	200.00
	Gail Potts, RN	5.93
	Prentice Hall, Inc.	13.81
	Public Employees Retirement	1,152.58
	H. Edwina Purcell	11.00
	Frank Racanelli	116.94
	Radio Shack	1,500.00
	Rale Electric Supply	769.84
	Raintree Publishers	544.57
	Rand's Camera & Hi Fi	71.61
	George Rao	15.52
	Readers Digest	229.10
	Morris Reby MD	405.00

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>Vouchers</u>
Daniel Regan	\$ 50.00	<u>Continued</u>
Eleanore Martin Renk	13.19	
The Reporter Newspaper	656.60	
James F. Rochford	175.00	
Dorothy Rohland	113.93	
Mrs. Judith Rosenberg	372.50	
M E Royer Tax Service	37.20	
Rugby School	2,740.00	
Rutger's Community Men	520.00	
Sargent-Welch Scientif	361.65	
Louis Scaduto	10.24	
John Schleig	18.20	
Scholastic Books	252.74	
School Bus Parts Co	112.99	
School Health Supply C	459.12	
Science Research Assoc	1,115.25	
Scoles System	1,097.90	
Scott Foresman & Co	5,476.81	
Scott Foresman	29.02	
Scribners Book Co., Inc	1,544.67	
Seabreeze Ford, Inc.	9.43	
Search Day Program	1,200.70	
Shore Music Center	18.00	
Simon & Schuster	121.06	
Simplicity Pattern Co.	13.50	
Singer Co.	600.00	
Sipersteins	406.25	
Sarah Ann Sked	81.66	
Slosson Educational Pu	26.40	
Somerset Co., Audio Vi	88.50	
South Western Publishin	171.84	
S & S Arts & Crafts	44.34	
Standard Lumber & Bldg.	319.68	
State Products Inc.	346.24	
Nicholas Stavres	87.50	
Steck-Vaughn Co.	519.97	
Janice Steiner	126.00	
Robert K. Stutts	250.00	
Suburban Propane	23.47	
Sunkist Growers	3.50	
Marianne Tarmy	190.00	
Teaching Resources Cor	168.93	
Thermaline Service Com	526.29	
Times-Observer	90.48	
Joseph Tomaselli	73.08	
Toms River Board of Ed	499.30	
Toms River Plumbing Su	1,402.58	
Toms River Tire, Inc.	782.40	
Township of Ocean School	14.00	
Trans. Credit Services	31.60	

<u>Vouchers</u>	<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
<u>Continued</u>	Travel Lodge	\$ 103.15
	Treasurer State of New	184.00
	Carol Treger	50.00
	Troll Associates	133.90
	Frank P. Turi	40.00
	Fredrick Underwood	50.00
	United Cerebral Palsy	5,110.00
	Upstart Library	52.53
	Valentine's Inc.	62.71
	Vannote Lumber Co.	145.72
	Van Sant Equipment	12.32
	Veterans Memorial Middle	49.50
	Annette E. Vicari	47.64
	Visual Sound Co.	924.66
	David D. Vivino	75.00
	Voya	15.00
	Vulcan Binder & Cover	218.46
	Eileen Walsh	19.80
	Linda Warlen	14.78
	Washington National In	951.94
	Weehawken Bd of Education	70.00
	Western Tapes	32.30
	Wholesale Educational	22.81
	B.L. Winch & Associate	7.45
	Ms. Mary Wolfe	120.00
	Warren H. Wolf	375.00
	James H Wolfersberger	164.70
	Woods School	638.40
	Patricia Wright	10.48
	Xerox Corp.	887.15
	Xerox Corp.	4,667.49
	Xerox Educational Publ.	49.00
	Xerox Education Public	151.45
	Elaine Yarusinsky	60.68
	Ronald J. Zink	75.00

The following bills have been paid but have not appeared on a previous list:

Associated Steel Products, Inc.	8,462.00
Mrs. Janet Beck	275.00
Brick Twp. Board of Education/ Improvement Authorization Account	211,789.00
Brick Township High School/ Athletic Account	4,492.54
Brick Twp. Memorial High School Athletic Account	2,509.53
Conservation & Environmental Studies Center, Inc.	65.00
Dean Oil Corporation	18,787.12

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>	<u>Vouchers</u>
Emma Havens Young/Office Account	\$ 14,000.00	<u>Continued</u>
Fine Arts Guild	72.00	
Foodtown of Brick	1,800.00	
Foodtown of Brick	539.81	
Franklin Institute	195.00	
Richard Hancock	179.36	
Lanes Mill School/Office Account	72.00	
Lanes Mill School/Office Account	222.00	
James McGuire, Treasurer, O.C.S.B.A.	228.00	
Music in the Parks	1,777.05	
NJ Employment Security Agency	15.26	
N.J. Employment Security Agency	15.00	
Postmaster/Board Office	750.00	
Postmaster/Board Office	800.00	
Emma Havens Young/Office Account	11.25	
	<u>\$267,056.92</u>	

PAYROLL - MAY, 1981

Brick Twp. Bd. of Ed./ Payroll Account	\$462,796.63 pp
Brick Twp. Bd. of Ed./Agency Account	337,262.56 pp
Brick Twp. Bd. of Ed./Payroll Account	484,164.29 pp
Brick Twp. Bd. of Ed./Payroll Account	44,347.65 pp
Brick Twp. Bd. of Ed./Agency Account	342,320.93 pp
Brick Twp. Bd. of Ed./Agency Account	17,553.35 pp

That the Board of Education approve the following banks for investment purposes by the Brick Township Board of Education:

Banks

Heritage Bank
 First National Bank of Toms River, NJ
 City Federal Savings and Loan Co.
 Citizens State Bank
 New Jersey National Bank
 Jersey Shore Savings and Loan
 Manasquan Savings and Loan Association

That the District Tax request schedule be approved as follows:

District
Tax

BRICK TOWNSHIP BOARD OF EDUCATION
DISTRICT TAX REQUEST SCHEDULE
1981-1982

<u>DATE OF</u> <u>REQUEST</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u> <u>CURRENT AND CAPITAL</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u> <u>DEBT SERVICE</u>	<u>TOTAL</u>
June 13, 1981	1,267,120.41	707,590.50	1,974,710.91
July 10, 1981	1,267,120.41	161,737.50	1,428,857.91
Aug. 14, 1981	1,267,120.41	303,696.00	1,570,816.41

<u>District</u> <u>Tax</u> <u>Continued</u>	<u>DATE OF</u> <u>REQUEST</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u> <u>CURRENT AND CAPITAL</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u> <u>DEBT SERVICE</u>	<u>TOTAL</u>
	Sept. 12, 1981	1,267,120.41		1,267,120.41
	Oct. 9, 1981	1,267,120.41		1,267,120.41
	Nov. 14, 1981	1,267,120.41	106,304.00	1,373,424.41
	Dec. 11, 1981	1,267,120.41		1,267,120.41
	Jan. 8, 1982	1,267,120.41		1,267,120.41
	Feb. 8, 1982	1,267,120.41		1,267,120.41
	Mar 12, 1982	1,267,210.41		1,267,120.41
	Apr 10, 1982	1,267,120.41		1,267,120.41
	May 14, 1982	<u>1,267,120.41</u>	<u> </u>	<u>1,267,120.49</u>
	TOTALS	15,205,445.00	1,279,328.00	16,484,773.00

Based on amounts to be raised by taxation for 1981-82

<u>CURRENT EXPENSE</u>	15,205,445.00
<u>DEBT SERVICE</u>	<u>1,279,328.00</u>
<u>TOTALS</u>	<u>16,484,773.00</u>

Record Bids That the Board of Education Record Bids for Custodial Supplies
Custodial received April 14, 1981 as follows:

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>NUMBER OF ITEMS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Thorsen Dist. Inc. P.O. BOX 664 Metuchen, NJ 08840	32	\$13,376.72
Jonah Service Co. 660 Franklin Blvd. Somerset, NJ 08873	39	29,538.82
Universal Janitorial Prod. 319 Apache Lane Brick, NJ 08723	26	21,797.00
Monmouth Paper Co. 506 Jersey Avenue P.O. Box 196 New Brunswick, NJ 08903	23	41,061.68

59

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>NUMBER OF ITEMS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
General Linen & Paper Co. 501 Grand Central Ave. Lavallette, NJ 08735	8	\$14,928.19
Independence Chemical Co. N. Railroad & Essex St. Gloucester City, NJ 08030	11	3,735.85
Utility Chemical Co. Sixth & Wait St. Paterson, NJ 07524	12	16,489.69
Hillyard, Inc. 604 Westmoreland Dr. Trenton, NJ 08616	9	21,242.80
Franklin Chemical & Equip. Co. 4050 Main Street Philadelphia, Pa. 19127	16	26,422.22
Airwick Professional Products Of Central Jersey, Inc. P.O. Box 589 Farmingdale, NJ 07727	2	1,563.60
Jalaine International Amway 625 Bayside Avenue Beachwood, NJ 08722	1	\$18,472.00

Record Bids
Custodial
Supplies
Continued

That the Board of Education Award Bids for Custodial Supplies received April 14, 1981 as follows:

<u>VENDOR</u>	<u>NUMBER OF ITEMS</u>	<u>AMOUNT</u>
Thorsen Dist., Inc.	11	\$ 2,326.84
Joanah Service Co.	19	21,391.64
Universal Janitorial	1	79.20
Monmouth Paper Co.	1	153.80
General Linen & Paper Co.	6	14,072.84
Independence Chemical Co.	1	427.80
Hillyard, Inc.	6	6,805.80
Franklin Chemical & Equip. Co.	2	1,719.40

Award Bids
Custodial
Supplies

That the Board of Education Reject Bids for Bus, Truck and Car Tires, Recapping and Tire Repairs and authorize the Business Administrator to re-bid these items.

Reject
Bids
Bus, Truck
& etc.