

Hanover Park Regional School DistrictWhippany Park HS Milling and Paving ProjectBid Tabulation
FKA Project No. 2019

June 10 @ 10:00 am

306 Ramapo Valley Road, Oakland, NJ 07436
P: 201-644-0505

	BASE BID	Alternate 1 Teacher's Parking Lot Work	Alternate 2 Lighting for Student Lot	Total Base Bid + Alternates
Contractor:				
Crossroads Pavement Maintenance	No Bid			\$ -
DLS Contracting	No Bid			\$ -
Frank Macchione/Paving Plus	No Bid			\$ -
Onorati Construction	No Bid			\$ -
D&L Paving Contractors	\$ 240,000.00	\$ 132,000.00	\$ 29,999.00	\$ 401,999.00
PMC Contracting	\$ 254,255.00	\$ 204,205.00	\$ 56,000.00	\$ 514,460.00
AJM Contractors, Inc.	\$ 275,000.00	\$ 175,000.00	\$ 66,000.00	\$ 516,000.00
Top Line Construction	\$ 266,415.00	\$ 200,680.00	\$ 64,350.00	\$ 531,445.00
V.A. Spatz & Sons	\$ 349,318.00	\$ 237,589.00	\$ 59,870.00	\$ 646,777.00